THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BID NO. 043-GGO03
STORAGE AND DELIVERY OF COMMODITY FOOD ITEMS

ANALYSIS OF BID COMPARED TO PREVIOUS CONTRACTS PLUS CPI INDEX

ltem # Description >>>

ftem 1: Dry Commodity Pick-Up

ltem 2: Frozen Commodity Pick-

ltem 3: Refrigerated Commodity

and Delivery Up and Delivery Pick-Up and Delivery
Trucks | cartons Cwt Est. oﬁmm_”a Cwt Est. | canons Cwt
Bidder's Name Est. Qty| PerTnak | Days | price Est. Cost Qty |PerTruck| Days | price Est. Cost Qty Pertuck| Days| price Est. Cost
School Food Service Systems 1 27 | 36 |$660 §$6,41520f 3 714 | 180 |$7.89 [[$302,502.60( 2 71 | 180 | $7.89 [$201,668.40
Southeast Frozen Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Previous Bid 046-DDO3 1 27 | 36 | $6.08 ||$6,784.56 1 3 71 | 189 | $6.08 113280,99386 [ 2 71 | 180 | $6.98 |[$178,408.80
wmw%moma pius CPI 38.6% 1 27 | 36 |s067 |$9.40340) 3 71 | 180 | $0.67 |$370,011.90 ) 2 71 | 180 | $0.67 |$247.274.60

ttem # Description>>> item 4: Dry Commodity Monthly ltem 5: Frozen Commodity ltem 6: Refrigerated Commodity
Storage Monthly Storage Monthly Storage
Price per carton Price per carton Price per carfon
Bidder's Name Est. Qty per month Est. Cost Est. Qty per month Est, Cost Est. Qty per month Est. Cost
School Food Service Systems No Bid No Bid No Bid
Southeast Frozen Foods 9128 $0.75  ||$6.846.00 38195 $0.75 $28,646.25 5832 $0.75 $4,374.00
Previous Big 046-DD03 9,128 $0.7472  136,820.67 38,195 $0.5782 || $22,084.60 5,832 $0.6669 $3,889.48
- Y
046-DDO3 plus CP1 3127 9128 $0.9803 [$8.94818) 33105 $0.7586 | $28.974.73 5832 $0.8750 | $5.103.00
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